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I would like to show appreciation to this writer just for rescuing me from this difficulty. As a result of checking
throughout the the web and finding recommendations that were not powerful, I figured my entire life was well over.
Living without the solutions to the problems you've solved by way of this article content is a crucial case, as well as
the kind which might have in a very negative way affected my entire career if I had not noticed your web page. Your
own personal knowledge and kindness in taking care of a lot of stuff was crucial. I am not sure what I would have
done if I hadn't encountered such a stuff like this. I'm able to at this time relish my future. Thanks for your time very
much for the high quality and result oriented guide. I will not hesitate to suggest your web page to any individual
who would like recommendations about this subject matter. "I can tell you we're watching those and we're studying
it. It's a really strong idea," he said. "As we watch the protesters, are we gonna see more groups coming in? Are we
gonna see more groups in and out the country as the protests go on? And if we do that, what's going to be different
about this situation? Is it going to be protesters at all protesting? That's one thing we're prepared for; we have an
incredible army of people from the other side." A fact-finding mission to Washington, Los Angeles, Miami and
Houston to assess law enforcement's handling of the Occupy movement, mission members concluded Thursday. The
Los Angeles County Sheriff's Department was the worst in terms of tactics, including use of rubber bullets and
chemical agents, according to the report, which was obtained by the Los Angeles Times. That report led to two
Justice Department inquiries, including one to the Los Angeles Police Department, which are ongoing. Newsom said
the report's findings show that the Los Angeles Police Department has changed its practices and that the federal
probe is an opportunity to learn from the city's experience. "We have to acknowledge that the LAPD has made the
biggest change," he said. "They have already made tremendous strides in the last few days. What the report shows
is that they can do it even better." The report, which was obtained by The Times, concludes that the Los Angeles
Police Department, with the help of city officials, used excessive force against the Occupy protesters. The
department, which had estimated the protest at between 40,000 and 60,000 demonstrators
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relevant factors, as long as the court makes ‘a clear error 11 of judgment’ in balancing those factors.” United States
v. 12 Fernandez, 443 F.3d 19, 27 (2d Cir. 2006) (quoting United 13 States v. Smith, 459 F.3d 254, 264 (2d Cir.

2006)). 14 Upon review, we identify no error in the district court’s 15 calculation of the Guidelines range or
imposition of a sentence 16 at the bottom of that range. In imposing the two-level 17 enhancement pursuant to
U.S.S.G. § 3A1.2(b)(2) for knowingly 18 placing a person, including an infant, in circumstances which 19 would

“constitute a substantial risk of physical injury to such 20 person or to another person” in the course of a robbery,
the 21 district court considered the sentencing factors set forth in 18 22 U.S.C. § 3553(a) and found that “there is a
substantial risk of 23 physical injury to an infant to be found when a gun is pointed 4 1 at her during a robbery.” The

district court’s conclusion was
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